
Index Disclaimer 

 
J.P. Morgan Securities Limited (the "Index Sponsor") does not sponsor, endorse or 
otherwise promote any security, other financial product or transaction (each a "Product") 
referencing the JPCCI Ex Front Month Agruicuture 10 ER Index (the “Index”).  The Index 
Sponsor makes no representation or warranty, express or implied, to the owners of any 
Product or any member of the public regarding the advisability of investing in securities or 
financial products generally or in the Product particularly or the ability of the Index to track the 
investment opportunities in the commodity futures market or otherwise achieve their 
objective.  The Index Sponsor has no obligation to take the needs of the owners of any 
Product or any other person into consideration in determining, composing or calculating the 
Index.  The Index Sponsor is not responsible for, has not participated and will not participate 
in the determination of the timing of, prices of, or quantities of any Product to be issued or in 
the determination or calculation of the equation by which the Product is to be converted into 
cash.  The Index Sponsor has no obligation or liability in connection with the administration, 
marketing or trading of any Product. 

THE INDEX IS DERIVED FROM SOURCES THAT ARE CONSIDERED RELIABLE, BUT 
THE INDEX SPONSOR DOES NOT GUARANTEE THE VERACITY, CURRENCY, 
COMPLETENESS OR ACCURACY OF THE INDEX OR OTHER INFORMATION 
FURNISHED IN CONNECTION WITH THE INDEX.  NO REPRESENTATION, WARRANTY 
OR CONDITION, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, STATUTORY OR OTHERWISE, AS TO 
CONDITION, SATISFACTORY QUALITY, PERFORMANCE, OR FITNESS FOR PURPOSE 
ARE GIVEN OR DUTY OR LIABILITY ASSUMED BY THE INDEX SPONSOR IN RESPECT 
OF THE INDEX OR ANY DATA INCLUDED THEREIN, OMISSIONS THEREFROM OR THE 
USE OF THE INDEX IN CONNECTION WITH ANY PRODUCT, AND ALL THOSE 
REPRESENTATIONS, WARRANTIES AND CONDITIONS ARE EXCLUDED SAVE TO THE 
EXTENT THAT SUCH EXCLUSION IS PROHIBITED BY LAW. 

To the fullest extent permitted by law, the Index Sponsor shall have no liability or 
responsibility to any person or entity for any loss, damages, costs, charges, expenses or 
other liabilities, including without limitation liability for any special, punitive, indirect or 
consequential damages (including, without limitation, lost profits, lost time and goodwill), even 
if notified of the possibility of such damages, whether arising in tort, contract, strict liability or 
otherwise, in connection with the use of the Index or in connection with any Product. 

The Index is the exclusive property of the Index Sponsor and the Index Sponsor retains all 
proprietary rights therein. 

 


